
Greetings 
 
My name is Giselle Miller and I am running for the Board of Directors of 
Winter Haven Resort. 
 
I live at 12 Sunset with husband Ray Raymond.  I have two grown sons, 
Brian and Paul, a delightful daughter-in-law Janine and two precious 
granddaughters, Kora and Remi.  Paul and Andrea are expecting their first 
baby in January.  I am blessed. 
 
My dad, Gerry Morin, and my mom, Peggy Morin, bought the lot at 12 Sunset 
in 1997 and spent the next few winters building their home.  I purchased 12 
Sunset in 2010 when my parents bought 15 Sunset, a bigger home that 
provided room for my brother, Jeffrey, to come down when they did to 
escape New York winters.  After my father passed in 2019, my mother and 
Jeffrey made Texas their full time residence. 
 
Ray and I have been full time residents since 2017 when I retired from the 
New York State Department of Corrections.  I was employed as a GED 
instructor at Auburn State Prison, a maximum-security facility.   Previously, 
I was employed in public schools as an Academic Intervention teacher.  I also 
taught as adjunct professor in the Graduate Reading Department at Saint 
Bonaventure University.   I enjoyed my career as a teacher in varied settings, 
and am particularly grateful for the insights I gained about people in these 
experiences. 
 
While I was still working, Ray and I were able to enjoy the amenities Winter 
Haven Resort offers during summer months.  We decided to make this our 
home when I retired.  I have worked on several committees including the 
Dance Committee for 3 years and the Activities Committee where I am still 
active.  During Covid, I had the opportunity to offer some assistance to the 
manager Tom Sinyard in writing grants. I am happy to say we got that grant. 
 
I am running for the Board of Directors in order to have the opportunity to 
serve the interests and needs of Winter Haven Resort residents.   
 
 
Giselle Miller 
 



 


